
$157,800 - 5485 Lac Le Jeune Road Unit# 22, Kamloops
MLS® #10350709 

$157,800
2 Bedroom, 1.00 Bathroom, 764 sqft
Single Family on 0.02 Acres

LAC LE JEUNE WILDERNESS RESORT,
Kamloops, British Columbia

For more information, please click Brochure
button.  Great 4 season vacation property with
rentals allowed. 1.5 levels, Newly renovated
cabin in Lac Le Jeune, 3 hours from
Vancouver. The cabin has been tastefully
upgraded: professionally painted, chinked and
stained logs, new interior fixtures, new hot
water tank, this cabin is turnkey and ready to
go! This cabin has a full kitchen, full bathroom,
private bedroom, a loft space with a double
bed and twin bed, and a generous open living
area. Cabin not zoned for permanent
residency. Cabin resort complex has an
amenities building that has a games room, a
pool, a large recreation space for corporate
events and weddings. The complex is on a
large pond and the area has lots of
opportunities for outdoor winter and summer
sports. Fees includes all utilities, contributions
to the contingency fund, amenity building use
and maintenance, exterior maintenance and
updates for the cabins and an on-site
caretaker. All measurements are approximate.
(id:6289)

Built in 1989

Essential Information

Listing # 10350709

Price $157,800

Bedrooms 2



Bathrooms 1.00

Square Footage 764

Acres 0.02

Year Built 1989

Type Single Family

Sub-Type Strata

Style Log house/cabin

Community Information

Address 5485 Lac Le Jeune Road Unit# 22

Subdivision LAC LE JEUNE WILDERNESS RESORT

City Kamloops

Province British Columbia

Postal Code V1S1Y8

Amenities

Amenities Clubhouse, Laundry Facility

Parking Spaces 2

Parking Additional Parking

Has Pool Yes

Pool Inground pool

Interior

Appliances Refrigerator, Cooktop - Electric, Microwave, Oven

Heating Baseboard heaters

# of Stories 2

Exterior

Roof Metal

Additional Information

Zoning Unknown

Listing Details

Listing Office Easy List Realty
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