
$988,000 - 2931 Thacker Drive, West Kelowna
MLS® #10362482 

$988,000
3 Bedroom, 3.00 Bathroom, 3,290 sqft
Single Family on 0.21 Acres

Lakeview Heights, West Kelowna, British
Columbia

Luxurious Lakeview Heights Home Listed
under BC Assessment - Experience
unparalleled luxury in this Lakeview Heights
home on the Wine Trail. Boasting three
bedrooms, three bathrooms, a pool, hot tub,
sauna, RV parking, an outdoor fire pit, a
charming pond with a babbling stream, and
two driveways, this property combines
convenience and relaxation. A sparkling pool
invites you to unwind, while the hot tub and
rejuvenating sauna promise relaxation. You
will appreciate the convenient RV parking.
Gather around the outdoor fire pit or enjoy the
tranquil pond with a meandering stream,
adding serenity to your outdoor space. Two
driveways provide ample parking space,
ensuring convenience for your vehicles and
guests. Inside, an open-concept layout and
ample natural light create a beautiful living
space. The kitchen is a chef's dream, and cozy
living areas are perfect for entertainment. The
master suite, with private outdoor access, is a
retreat. Additional bedrooms offer space for
family, guests, or a home office. Surrounded
by lush landscaping and well-maintained
lawns, the property ensures privacy and
tranquility. Located in a desirable Lakeview
Heights neighborhood, zoning allows for a
carriage home. Minutes from world-class
wineries, hiking trails, shopping, and dining,
this location blends convenience with
Okanagan's natural beauty. Don't miss this
chance to own a property that combines luxury



and comfort! (id:6289)

Built in 1975

Essential Information

Listing # 10362482

Price $988,000

Bedrooms 3

Bathrooms 3.00

Half Baths 1

Square Footage 3,290

Acres 0.21

Year Built 1975

Type Single Family

Sub-Type Freehold

Style Ranch

Community Information

Address 2931 Thacker Drive

Subdivision Lakeview Heights

City West Kelowna

Province British Columbia

Postal Code V1Z1X1

Amenities

Amenities Golf Nearby, Park, Recreation, Schools, Shopping, Ski area

Features Private setting, Corner Site

Parking Spaces 7

Parking Additional Parking, Attached Garage

# of Garages 1

View Mountain view

Is Waterfront Yes

Waterfront Other

Has Pool Yes

Pool Inground pool

Interior

Appliances Refrigerator, Dishwasher, Dryer, Range - Electric, Washer



Heating Forced air, See remarks

Cooling Central air conditioning

Fireplace Yes

# of Fireplaces 2

Fireplaces Gas,Wood

# of Stories 2

Exterior

Exterior Stucco

Exterior Features Landscaped, Underground sprinkler

Roof Asphalt shingle

Additional Information

Zoning Unknown

Listing Details

Listing Office Sotheby's International Realty Canada
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