
$975,000 - 1420 Inkar Road, Kelowna
MLS® #10363764 

$975,000
3 Bedroom, 3.00 Bathroom, 1,837 sqft
Single Family on 1.00 Acres

1420 Inkar Road, Kelowna, British Columbia

Discover the perfect blend of style, comfort,
and functionality in this one-of-a-kind
rancherâ€”designed for modern living and
effortless entertaining. From the moment you
arrive, the beautiful brick-accented exterior,
spacious 3 car garage, and dedicated 50 amp
RV hookup set the tone for a home that truly
has it all. There's plenty of space to park your
RV, boat, or toysâ€”ideal for adventure lovers!
Inside, the heart of the home is a stunning
chefâ€™s kitchen featuring quartz
countertops, high-end appliances, and sleek
cabinetryâ€”perfect for hosting or daily
gourmet meals. Rich hardwood floors flow
throughout, leading into a bright, oversized
living room with expansive windows and a
cozy wood-burning fireplace. With 3 generous
bedrooms and 3 bathrooms, the primary suite
is a true retreat with a walk-in closet and
spa-inspired ensuite. Need extra space or
income potential? A separate entrance leads
to a versatile bar/lounge area with incredible
Airbnb or guest suite possibilities. Step outside
to your private oasisâ€”complete with a fully
fenced backyard, lush garden beds, a relaxing
hot tub, and a low-maintenance composite and
concrete patio for year-round enjoyment.
Stylish, spacious, and loaded with
extrasâ€”this rare gem offers something for
everyone! (id:6289)

Built in 1979

Essential Information



Listing # 10363764

Price $975,000

Bedrooms 3

Bathrooms 3.00

Half Baths 2

Square Footage 1,837

Acres 1.00

Year Built 1979

Type Single Family

Sub-Type Strata

Style Ranch

Community Information

Address 1420 Inkar Road

Subdivision 1420 Inkar Road

City Kelowna

Province British Columbia

Postal Code V1Y8H7

Amenities

Amenities Public Transit, Park, Recreation, Schools, Shopping

Features Level lot

Parking Spaces 3

Parking Additional Parking, Attached Garage, Heated Garage

# of Garages 3

Interior

Appliances Refrigerator, Dishwasher, Dryer, Range - Electric, Microwave, Washer

Heating Forced air, See remarks

Cooling Central air conditioning

Fireplace Yes

# of Fireplaces 1

Fireplaces Wood

# of Stories 1

Exterior

Exterior Brick, Wood siding, Other

Exterior Features Landscaped, Level, Underground sprinkler

Roof Asphalt shingle



Additional Information

Zoning Unknown

Listing Details

Listing Office Chamberlain Property Group
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