
$325,000 - 2433 Ingram Road Unit# 4, West Kelowna
MLS® #10365206 

$325,000
2 Bedroom, 1.00 Bathroom, 961 sqft
Single Family on 1.00 Acres

Leisure Gardens, West Kelowna, British
Columbia

Welcome to Leisure Gardens! This
meticulously maintained 2-bedroom, 1-bath
home is tucked into a sought-after 55+
community in the heart of West Kelowna. From
your living room or spacious deck, take in
beautiful lake and mountain views â€” a
peaceful backdrop for morning coffee or
evening sunsets.  The updated kitchen is
bright and functional, offering plenty of storage
and a clean, modern feel. A cute front patio
provides a lovely spot to sit and enjoy the day.
The home also includes a single detached
garage for parking or additional storage. Pride
of ownership shines throughout â€” this home
has been lovingly cared for and is truly
move-in ready. Enjoy the friendly, welcoming
atmosphere that makes Leisure Gardens such
a special place to call home, all within minutes
of shops, restaurants, and local amenities.
(id:6289)

Built in 1987

Essential Information

Listing # 10365206

Price $325,000

Bedrooms 2

Bathrooms 1.00

Square Footage 961

Acres 1.00

Year Built 1987



Type Single Family

Sub-Type Strata

Style Ranch

Community Information

Address 2433 Ingram Road Unit# 4

Subdivision Leisure Gardens

City West Kelowna

Province British Columbia

Postal Code V4T1L5

Amenities

Features One Balcony

Parking Spaces 1

Parking Detached Garage

# of Garages 1

View Lake view, Mountain view, View (panoramic)

Interior

Appliances Refrigerator, Dishwasher, Dryer, Range - Electric, Microwave, Washer

Heating Electric Hot Water, Other

Cooling See Remarks

Fireplace Yes

# of Fireplaces 1

Fireplaces Gas

# of Stories 1

Exterior

Exterior Stucco

Exterior Features Underground sprinkler

Roof Other

Additional Information

Zoning Unknown

Listing Details

Listing Office eXp Realty (Kelowna)
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