
$499,900 - 139 Carnoustie Drive, Hammonds Plains
MLS® #202512237 

$499,900
4 Bedroom, 2.00 Bathroom, 2,190 sqft
Single Family on 0.00 Acres

Hammonds Plains, Hammonds Plains, Nova
Scotia

Welcome to life in the Knolls of Glen Arbour!
This beautiful end-unit bungalow offers the
perfect blend of comfort, style, and peaceful
surroundings. Enjoy your morning coffee or
unwind in the evening sun on your own
spacious, private balcony, surrounded by
nature. Inside, you'll find a bright,
open-concept main floor with a beautiful
kitchen that flows seamlessly into the dining
and living areas, ideal for entertaining or
simply relaxing at home. The main level
features two bedrooms, including a generous
primary bedroom with a walk-in closet and full
ensuite. A second bedroom is conveniently
located next to the main bath and laundry
area. Downstairs, theres a large home office
and an additional bedroom with its own walk-in
closet, great for guests or older children. The
unfinished walkout basement offers tons of
potential, whether you envision a gym, theatre
room, or extra living space, it's ready for your
personal touch. *Staged photos are taken from
a staged model home to illustrate how the
space can be furnished and decorated.
(id:6289)

Built in 2009

Essential Information

Listing # 202512237

Price $499,900



Bedrooms 4

Bathrooms 2.00

Square Footage 2,190

Acres 0.00

Year Built 2009

Type Single Family

Sub-Type Condominium/Strata

Style Bungalow

Community Information

Address 139 Carnoustie Drive

Subdivision Hammonds Plains

City Hammonds Plains

Province Nova Scotia

Postal Code B4B0E5

Amenities

Amenities Golf Course, Playground

Features Balcony

Parking Attached Garage, Concrete, Garage

# of Garages 2

Interior

Appliances Stove, Dishwasher, Dryer, Washer, Microwave, Refrigerator

# of Stories 1

Exterior

Exterior Brick, Vinyl, Other

Foundation Poured Concrete

Listing Details

Listing Office RE/MAX Nova (Halifax)
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