
$804,900 - 910 1650 Granville Street, Halifax
MLS® #202514629 

$804,900
2 Bedroom, 2.00 Bathroom, 1,000 sqft
Single Family on 0.00 Acres

Halifax, Halifax, Nova Scotia

The Roy - Live your best life in downtown! 
This 2 bedroom plus den condo gives you
breath taking city views from the 335 sq foot
wrap around terrace where you can relax on a
warm summer evening with friends and family
and enjoy the hustle and bustle of the city
energy.  The Roy offers the highest level of
service, amenities, fitness and convenience. 
Each of the spacious bedrooms offers an
ensuite bath, there is a dedicated office space,
in suite laundry and open concept living room /
kitchen.  Quartz surfaces in baths and kitchen,
beautifully tiled showers, and engineered
hardwood throughout.  The amenities you will
enjoy included with your condo fees are
concierge services, gym, treatment room,
indoor swimming pool, private theatre, heated
above ground parking, also included in your
condo fees are common area maintenance,
building maintenance, and water.   Why not
live the life you deserve in Halifax's truly
luxurious building. (id:6289)

Built in 2020

Essential Information

Listing # 202514629

Price $804,900

Bedrooms 2

Bathrooms 2.00

Square Footage 1,000

Acres 0.00



Year Built 2020

Type Single Family

Sub-Type Condominium/Strata

Community Information

Address 910 1650 Granville Street

Subdivision Halifax

City Halifax

Province Nova Scotia

Postal Code B3J0E1

Amenities

Parking Garage, Parking Space(s)

# of Garages 1

Has Pool Yes

Pool Inground pool

Interior

Appliances Cooktop, Oven, Dishwasher, Dryer, Washer, Refrigerator

Cooling Central air conditioning, Heat Pump

# of Stories 1

Exterior

Exterior Other

Foundation Poured Concrete

Listing Details

Listing Office Verve Realty Group
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