
$474,000 - 940 210 Highway, Waterloo
MLS® #202515122 

$474,000
4 Bedroom, 2.00 Bathroom, 1,404 sqft
Single Family on 2.80 Acres

Waterloo, Waterloo, Nova Scotia

Lakefront Farm House.  Rain or shine relax
and enjoy the covered Varanda overlooking
landscaped mature gardens & century old
trees.  This quaint 4 bedroom, nicely updated
and well maintained home would be a
wonderful primary residence or cottage. For
those who enjoy privacy there is a large main
level primary suite with bonus space perfect
for a home office.  Second level offers 3
additional bedrooms and full bath.  The large
walkout basement offers endless possibilities.
There is plenty of room for a workshop and/or
a craft  room and loads of storage. This lovely
home sits on (2.8 acres) of landscaped
gardens and a large field,  the extended paved
driveway leads to a detached double garage. 
This property offers 20ft of direct lake front. 
Just turn the key and start living life at the
lake.  St Georges Lake is ideal for swimming,
kayaking, paddle boarding and canoeing.
(id:6289)

Essential Information

Listing # 202515122

Price $474,000

Bedrooms 4

Bathrooms 2.00

Square Footage 1,404

Acres 2.80

Type Single Family

Sub-Type Freehold



Community Information

Address 940 210 Highway

Subdivision Waterloo

City Waterloo

Province Nova Scotia

Postal Code B4V8J7

Amenities

Features Sloping

Parking Detached Garage, Garage, Paved Yard

# of Garages 2

Is Waterfront Yes

Waterfront Waterfront on lake

Interior

Appliances Range - Electric, Dishwasher, Dryer, Washer, Microwave Range Hood
Combo, Refrigerator

Cooling Heat Pump

# of Stories 2

Exterior

Exterior Vinyl

Exterior Features Landscaped

Foundation Poured Concrete

Listing Details

Listing Office Bryant Realty Atlantic
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