
$359,750 - 240 Lesley Street, Hilden
MLS® #202520445 

$359,750
3 Bedroom, 3.00 Bathroom, 1,959 sqft
Single Family on 0.29 Acres

Hilden, Hilden, Nova Scotia

Set on a quiet street, and conveniently located
near Hilden elementary and just 12 minutes
from downtown Truro, this 4-level split entry
home offers 3 good sized bedrooms and 2.5
baths. All 3 bedrooms are ideally located on
the second level, with the primary bedroom
featuring a 3-piece ensuite and walk-in closet.
The open concept kitchen/living room features
a beautiful pine ceiling and walk out to the
spacious and comfortable back deck - perfect
for enjoying your morning coffee! The lower
level offers a large L-shaped rec room, laundry
and half bath and continues to the basement
where there is plenty of room for storage.
Outside, you will enjoy the peacefulness and
privacy given by the many trees surrounding
the property and the partially fenced yard.
(id:6289)

Built in 1989

Essential Information

Listing # 202520445

Price $359,750

Bedrooms 3

Bathrooms 3.00

Half Baths 1

Square Footage 1,959

Acres 0.29

Year Built 1989

Type Single Family



Sub-Type Freehold

Style 4 Level

Community Information

Address 240 Lesley Street

Subdivision Hilden

City Hilden

Province Nova Scotia

Postal Code B0N1C0

Amenities

Amenities Playground

Features Treed, Level

Parking Gravel

Interior

Appliances Central Vacuum, Cooktop - Electric, Oven - Electric, Dryer, Washer,
Refrigerator

Cooling Heat Pump

# of Stories 2

Has Basement Yes

Exterior

Exterior Brick, Vinyl

Foundation Poured Concrete

Listing Details

Listing Office Royal LePage Truro Real Estate
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