
$184,900 - 304 607 10th Street, Humboldt
MLS® #SK007357 

$184,900
2 Bedroom, 1.00 Bathroom, 872 sqft
Single Family

N/A, Humboldt, Saskatchewan

Bright open third floor Condo at Parkland
Condominiums for Sale! This 2 bedroom suite
has access to balcony overlooking the city
skyline just off your living room. Enter this suite
into a bright open foyer with Okanagen Desert
Canyon vinyl plank floors throughout the unit.
The kitchen will have winter maple cabinets
with counter tops, fridge, glass top stove, B/I
dishwasher and microwave rangehood
included. The living room allows lots of natural
light through the patio doors and boasts a wall
air conditioner. A bright hallway leads you to
the two bedrooms with closets. The laundry
room is spacious and conveniently located
across from bedrooms, includes washer/dryer.
A 4 pc bath with winter maple cabinets. The
windows and patio doors will have window
treatments. One electrified exterior parking
stall included. Enjoy living close to downtown,
shopping, schools and services. Buyers to
contact City of Humboldt for more information
regarding taxes. Close to downtown Humboldt
and approx 45 min from BHP Jansen Mine
site. Call today to view! (id:6289)

Built in 1983

Essential Information

Listing # SK007357

Price $184,900

Bedrooms 2

Bathrooms 1.00



Square Footage 872

Year Built 1983

Type Single Family

Sub-Type Condominium/Strata

Style Low rise

Community Information

Address 304 607 10th Street

Subdivision N/A

City Humboldt

Province Saskatchewan

Postal Code S0K2A0

Amenities

Features Balcony

Parking Gravel, Parking Space(s), Surfaced

Interior

Appliances Washer, Refrigerator, Intercom, Dishwasher, Dryer, Microwave, Stove

Heating Natural gas Baseboard heaters, Hot Water

Cooling Wall unit

Listing Details

Listing Office Century 21 Fusion - Humboldt
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